
Luxury holiday villa near Cala Es Calo in Formentera for rent, Formentera/Ibiza -

Ibiza - Eivissa

Overview Location

Building surface: 600 m²

Plot of land: 30,000 m²

Distribution: 5 Bed rooms, 4 Bathrooms

Ref.-No.: 1943

Price: on request

Location: Ibiza - Eivissa

View: Sea Access
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Description
This luxury holiday villa is located on the paradise island of Formentera, Ibiza’s serene and unspoiled sister
island. Set in a tranquil environment near Cala Es Calo, this exclusive retreat offers the perfect blend of
elegance, comfort, and nature. Designed with high-quality furnishings and an international chic aesthetic,
the villa provides a sophisticated yet relaxed atmosphere for an unforgettable stay.

The spacious living area is thoughtfully designed with stylish decor and modern amenities, featuring a
flat-screen satellite TV and a DVD player, creating a cozy entertainment space for guests. The fully
equipped kitchen includes an oven, dishwasher, and high-end appliances, making it ideal for preparing
meals at home. The dining area offers a stunning view of the lush 30,000-square-meter garden, enhancing
the sense of peace and immersion in nature.

The villa offers five beautifully designed double bedrooms, comfortably accommodating up to ten guests.
The ground floor features two double rooms, one of which includes an additional folding bed, a private
terrace, and a private bathroom. On the upper floor, three additional double bedrooms each have a private
terrace and an en-suite bathroom. An additional living area upstairs provides an extra space for relaxation.
The house includes four modern bathrooms, each designed with high-end finishes.

Designed for comfort in every season, the villa is equipped with air conditioning and WiFi throughout,
ensuring a pleasant and connected stay for all guests. The seamless indoor-outdoor flow enhances the
natural beauty of the surroundings, creating an inviting environment where guests can fully unwind.

The outdoor areas of the property are as impressive as the interiors. Set on a vast 30,000-square-meter
private estate, the villa is surrounded by beautifully maintained gardens, providing a peaceful oasis of
greenery. A large swimming pool offers a refreshing escape, with ample space for sunbathing and relaxing
by the water. The house also features a spacious outdoor terrace, perfect for al fresco dining and enjoying
warm Mediterranean evenings.

The villa’s prime location offers easy access to some of Formentera’s most stunning beaches. Cala Es
Calo, a nearby coastal paradise, is known for its crystal-clear waters and picturesque surroundings. Here,
guests can find charming restaurants, beachfront bars, and a supermarket for convenience. The famous
Migjorn Beach, with its trendy beach bars and fine dining options, is just a ten-minute walk away. For those
looking to explore further, La Savina and the island’s main port are just a five-minute drive from the villa,
ensuring effortless access to Ibiza and beyond.

This villa is the perfect destination for those seeking a luxurious yet tranquil getaway on Formentera.
Whether spending days lounging by the pool, enjoying the island’s pristine beaches, or dining under the
stars on the terrace, this property offers an unparalleled experience of Mediterranean elegance. Ideal for
families, groups of friends, or anyone looking for a private retreat in one of the most beautiful corners of the
Balearic Islands, this villa is a rare and exceptional rental opportunity.
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